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Subject: Non-confidence vote of Prime Minister Justin Trudeau  

Importance: High 

February 4, 2022 

Her Excellency the Right Honourable Mary May Simon 

Rideau Hall 

1 Sussex Drive 

Ottawa, Ontario 

Canada 

K1A 0A1 

Dear Right Honourable Simon. 

I am writing to you as a husband, father, and Canadian citizen. I am also speaking on behalf of my wife 
and children. 

Over the past several months we have seen friends and family lose their access to education, jobs, and 
civil rights to live as free Canadians. 

Our youngest son who started his first year of university this past fall was de-enrolled, without re-
imbursement, for making an educated medical decision regarding his bodily autonomy.  He had a 
previous covid infection, recovered without medical intervention, but the university refuses to recognize 
his Mayo Clinic report showing he has natural immunity. He of the highest risk age group, and as a male, 
for myocarditis by taking the experimental vaccine as many current studies have shown. Two of his 
acquaintances, slightly older, have had heart issues since taking the experimental vaccine and have been 
advised by doctors to take Tylenol. I’m not sure if this is the proper course of action and it seems very 
dismissive, but I’m not a doctor. 

We are seeing a concerning trend from Justin Trudeau to further divide and alienate all Canadians from 
one another. He has called people, like my son, a racist and misogynist without knowing a thing about 
him. My son is now excluded from an education, the ability to travel by plane to visit family in western 
Canada, enjoy restaurants, movies, and performances with his family and friends. If Justin Trudeau’s 
goal was to separate and alienate Canadian citizens, he has done his job with my son. 

With this latest freedom rally in Ottawa, Trudeau has continued to divide the Canadian public and 
categorize these voices that wish to be heard as racists and conspiracy theorists among other 
derogatory comments. In his original press conference, he does not recognize these people as Canadian 
Citizens and plagues them with more degrading comments and references as such as “Anti Vaxx” when 
it is clearly an experimental vaccine choice as some of these protesters have already received the 

mailto:info@gg.ca


experimental vaccine. He refuses to recognize the movement of Freedom and focuses on the 
“desecration” of two cars parked at the base of the steps of our war memorial and Canadian flags and a 
freedom placard placed on Terry Fox as defacing a national hero. Of the tens of thousands at the 
protest, he feels that the individual(s) that chose to carry a Nazi, and another with the confederate, flag 
speak for the entire group and once again does not focus on the problem at hand, that there are 
peaceful and thoughtful Canadians asking to be heard. He chooses to ignore their right to speak with 
him to come to a mutual understanding of how to serve us better and resolve matters with dignity and 
respect. Based on the information I have seen, through various media sources, it appears that he is 
intentionally misleading the Canadian people. 

I will not debate the necessity or efficacy of these experimental vaccines. There are several real reports 
and studies from around the world that show the data, and everyone should have the choice if it is right 
for them. This is freedom of choice, bodily autonomy, and should not be ruled by mandates on society. 

Trudeau’s history of parading around in blackface and at least one instance of inappropriate touching of 
a reporter, that Trudeau feels may have been taken out of context “as men and women see things 
differently” , does not demonstrate a leader with a moral compass or give him the right to generalize a 
term such as a racist and misogynist towards anyone that has an opinion contrary to his own. 

The fact remains that our Prime Minister, Justin Trudeau, has a clear record of personal and political 
misconduct, lack of respect and compassion for our indigenous peoples, and a blatant disregard of the 
rights and freedoms of all Canadian citizens regardless of race, color, or sexual orientation.  

Among many other deficits I believe that Justin Trudeau does not have the capacity to: 

1.Lead this country as a fair, non-partisan Canadian Prime Minister with the citizens best interests. 

2.Differentiate between hateful acts and protests of freedom of expression and the rights and freedoms 
of Canadians. 

3.Learn from his previous mistakes and accept responsibility for them. 

4.Have the compassion to allow all Canadians to be heard and represented by his leadership. 

5.To provide honesty and transparency when asked specific questions of National importance or his 
leadership. 

Like many other Canadians we spend our days living with fear and anxiety as to what Trudeau will do 
next to strip all Canadians of their rights and freedoms and continue with discriminatory remarks and 
actions toward those who choose not to take these experimental vaccines. These experimental vaccines 
have no long-term studies, no efficacy to prevent infection or transmission and no liability from the 
manufacturers for long term adverse effects, injuries, or death. The fact that Canadians are being 
coerced to participate in this experiment is morally wrong and criminal. 

As a result of these and many other dishonorable actions I request that you endorse a non-confidence 
vote of Prime Minister Justin Trudeau in Parliament. 

 

Sincerely, 


